2024 Coarse Aggregate Pg 1
WEXFORD COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

BID TABULATION SHEET / %l
DATE: 2/ 2%
/
TIME: 2.9% [~
Bidder 25A Slag 23A Nat 23A Limestone 6AA Crushed 6AA Crushed Nat 6AA Washed Nat 10A
Team Elmers
All prices Delivered $41.83/ton $20.88 fton $30.90/ton $37.90/ton $36.18/ton $29.58/ton $31.05 /ton
$20.50 /ton $38.80 / ton $26.00 /ton $31.20/ton
Callahan Supply No Bid delivered No Bid delivered No Bid delivered Delivered

QWL-’VL& »LJEF?’; 7 jLL p\f\/

(
\



2024 Coarse Aggregate Pg 2

WEXFORD COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

BID TABULATION SHEET / /
DATE: 912 |2
|
TIME: 7 . 0%
Bidder 22A 21AA Limestone 17A Crushed H-1 Limestone %" minus Crushed 8-12 Riprap Natural Fill Sand
Team Elmers
All Prices Delivered No Bid $30.90 /ton $41.15 / ton $38.25 /ton $33.86/ ton $161.20/ ton No Bid
$2.35 / Ton —Manton
$19.50/ ton $38.30/ ton $6.00/ton-Cadillac

Callahan Supply delivered delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Pick up Price




