2024 Culvert/Bridge Materials Pg 1

WEXFORD COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

BID TABULATION SHEET _ /
DATE:  7/2v r‘/
T ‘! [
Me: 2" Y
Bidder ” o » o ”o ” o ” o "o "o ”oa »” o=
—_— 12" pipe 15” pipe 18" pipe 21" pipe 24" pipe 27" pipe 30" pipe 36" pipe 42" pipe
Northern Concrete
Pipe $15.66/Ift | $19.64/Lft | $25.88/Lft $32.00/Ift $39.98/Lft $52.96/Lft $63.76/Lft 585.28/Lft $108.92/Lft
16 Gauge
$17.85/Lft
16 Gauge 16 Gauge 16 Gauge 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 14 Gauge 14 Gauge No Bid
Cadillac Culvert Inc $9.50/Ift $11.25/Lft $13.60/Lft $15.25/Lft $24.50/Lft No Bid $31.00/Lft $35.00/Lft
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2024 Culvert/Bridge Materials Pg 2

WEXFORD COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

UJ—% Wi {:C _/Xéﬁ)/ 73 (} A

BID TABULATION SHEET 7 [ yj
DATE: idial
=
TIME: 7 - .‘ '
Bidd 8'x4’ Box 10'x4’ Box 10’x5’ Box 12’'x4’ Box 6’x4’ Box culvert
slacer 48" pipe 24” concCB | 36" ConcCB | 48" Conc MH Culvert culvert culvert culvert
Northern Concrete
Pipe $142.60/Lft | $76.00/Vfit | $86.00/Vft | $115.00/Vft | $630.00/Lft | $927.00/Lft | $985.00/Lft $1285.00/Lft $529.00/Lft
12 Gauge . .
Cadillac Culvert Inc | $65.00/Lft | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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